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The Canlit Foodbook Jul 25 2023
The Edible Woman Notes Apr 09 2022 Ever since her engagement, the
strangest thing has been happening to Marian McAlpin: she can't eat.
The Blind Assassin Dec 06 2021 “Ten days after the war ended, my
sister Laura drove a car off a bridge.” These words are spoken by Iris
Chase Griffen, married at eighteen to a wealthy industrialist but now
poor and eighty-two. Iris recalls her far from exemplary life, and the
events leading up to her sister’s death, gradually revealing the
carefully guarded Chase family secrets. Among these is “The Blind
Assassin,” a novel that earned the dead Laura Chase not only notoriety
but also a devoted cult following. Sexually explicit for its time, it was a
pulp fantasy improvised by two unnamed lovers who meet secretly in
rented rooms and seedy cafés. As this novel-within-a-novel twists and
turns through love and jealousy, self-sacrifice and betrayal, so does the
real narrative, as both move closer to war and catastrophe. Margaret
Atwood’s Booker Prize-winning sensation combines elements of gothic
drama, romantic suspense, and science fiction fantasy in a
spellbinding tale.
Women's Issues in Margaret Atwood's The Handmaid's Tale Jul 01
2021 The Handmaid's Tale depicts a dystopian society in which a
religious dictatorship assumes control of the United States, turning
the country into the Republic of Gilead. In this new society, women are
stripped of autonomy and often relegated to roles such as servant or
childbearing maid. Since the book's publication in 1985, it has become
a popular point of reference to guard against government interference
in women's rights and issues. This informative edition takes a critical
look at Atwood's life and writings, with a specific focus on key ideas
related to The Handmaid's Tale. The book collects a series of essays
pertaining to feminism, sexism, and religious fundamentalism, creating
points of discussion for readers that are both modern and relevant.
The text also discusses contemporary women's issues and presents

perspectives on topics such as surrogacy, same-sex marriage, and
modesty.
Bodily Harm Nov 28 2023 From the author of the New York Times
bestselling novels The Handmaid’s Tale—now an Emmy Award-
winning Hulu original series—and Alias Grace, now a Netflix original
series. A powerfully and brilliantly crafted novel, Bodily Harm is the
story of Rennie Wilford, a young journalist whose life has begun to
shatter around the edges. Rennie flies to the Caribbean to recuperate,
and on the tiny island of St. Antoine she is confronted by a world
where her rules for survival no longer apply. By turns comic, satiric,
relentless, and terrifying, Margaret Atwood's Bodily Harm is ultimately
an exploration of the lust for power, both sexual and political, and the
need for compassion that goes beyond what we ordinarily mean by
love.
Cat's Eye Apr 02 2024 A breathtaking novel of a woman grappling
with the tangled knot of her life—from the bestselling author of The
Handmaid's Tale and The Testaments Disturbing, humorous, and
compassionate, Cat’s Eye is the story of Elaine Risley, a controversial
painter who returns to Toronto, the city of her youth, for a
retrospective of her art. Engulfed by vivid images of the past, she
reminisces about a trio of girls who initiated her into the the fierce
politics of childhood and its secret world of friendship, longing, and
betrayal. Elaine must come to terms with her own identity as a
daughter, a lover, an artist, and a woman—but above all she must seek
release form her haunting memories.
The Handmaid's Tale Mar 09 2022 An instant classic and eerily
prescient cultural phenomenon, from “the patron saint of feminist
dystopian fiction” (New York Times). Now an award-winning Hulu
series starring Elizabeth Moss. In this multi-award-winning,
bestselling novel, Margaret Atwood has created a stunning Orwellian
vision of the near future. This is the story of Offred, one of the
unfortunate “Handmaids” under the new social order who have only
one purpose: to breed. In Gilead, where women are prohibited from
holding jobs, reading, and forming friendships, Offred’ s persistent
memories of life in the “time before” and her will to survive are acts of
rebellion. Provocative, startling, prophetic, and with Margaret
Atwood’s devastating irony, wit, and acute perceptive powers in full
force, The Handmaid’s Tale is at once a mordant satire and a dire
warning.
Cat's Eye Mar 28 2021 Cat’s Eye is the story of Elaine Risley, a
controversial painter who returns to Toronto, the city of her youth, for
a retrospective of her art. Engulfed by vivid images of the past, she
reminisces about a trio of girls who initiated her into the fierce politics
of childhood and its secret world of friendship, longing, and betrayal.
By turns disquieting, humorous, compassionate, haunting and
mordant, Cat’s Eye is vintage Atwood.

Girl One Dec 18 2022 Orphan Black meets Margaret Atwood in this
twisty supernatural thriller about female power and the bonds of
sisterhood Josephine Morrow is Girl One, the first of nine Miracle
Babies conceived without male DNA on an experimental commune
known as the Homestead. The Girls were raised in the shadow of
controversy—plagued by zealots calling them aberrations and their
mothers demons—until a devastating fire at the Homestead claimed
the lives of three people, leaving the survivors to scatter across the
United States. Years later, upon learning that her mother has gone
missing, Josie sets off on a desperate road trip, tracking down the only
people who might help: her estranged sisters. Tracing clues her
mother left behind, Josie joins forces with two of the Girls, and they
journey back through their past, uncovering secrets about their origins
and unlocking devastating abilities they never knew they had. Girl One
combines the provocative imagination of Naomi Alderman’s The Power
with the propulsive, cinematic storytelling of a Marvel movie. In her
electrifying, wildly entertaining new novel, Sara Flannery Murphy
delivers a rousing tale of love, ambition, power, and the extraordinary
bonds of sisterhood.
Inseparable Apr 29 2021 Finalist for the French-American Florence
Gould Translation Prize A novel by the iconic Simone de Beauvoir of an
intense and vivid girlhood friendship that, unpublished in her lifetime,
displays “Beauvoir's genius as a fiction writer”(Wall Street Journal)
From the moment Sylvie and Andrée meet in their Parisian day school,
they see in each other an accomplice with whom to confront the
mysteries of girlhood. For the next ten years, the two are the closest of
friends and confidantes as they explore life in a post-World War One
France, and as Andrée becomes increasingly reckless and rebellious,
edging closer to peril. Sylvie, insightful and observant, sees a France
of clashing ideals and religious hypocrisy—and at an early age is
determined to form her own opinions. Andrée, a tempestuous dreamer,
is inclined to melodrama and romance. Despite their different natures
they rely on each other to safeguard their secrets while entering
adulthood in a world that did not pay much attention to the wills and
desires of young women. Deemed too intimate to publish during
Simone de Beauvoir’s life, Inseparable offers fresh insight into the
groundbreaking feminist’s own coming-of-age; her transformative,
tragic friendship with her childhood friend Zaza Lacoin; and how her
youthful relationships shaped her philosophy. Sandra Smith’s vibrant
translation of the novel will be long cherished by de Beauvoir devotees
and first-time readers alike.
Moral Disorder Oct 04 2021 Atwood triumphs with these dazzling,
personal stories in her first collection since Wilderness Tips. In these
ten interrelated stories Atwood traces the course of a life and also the
lives intertwined with it, while evoking the drama and the humour that
colour common experiences — the birth of a baby, divorce and
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remarriage, old age and death. With settings ranging from Toronto,
northern Quebec, and rural Ontario, the stories begin in the present,
as a couple no longer young situate themselves in a larger world no
longer safe. Then the narrative goes back in time to the forties and
moves chronologically forward toward the present. In “The Art of
Cooking and Serving,” the twelve-year-old narrator does her best to
accommodate the arrival of a baby sister. After she boldly declares her
independence, we follow the narrator into young adulthood and then
through a complex relationship. In “The Entities,” the story of two
women haunted by the past unfolds. The magnificent last two stories
reveal the heartbreaking old age of parents but circle back again to
childhood, to complete the cycle. By turns funny, lyrical, incisive,
tragic, earthy, shocking, and deeply personal, Moral Disorder displays
Atwood’s celebrated storytelling gifts and unmistakable style to their
best advantage. This is vintage Atwood, writing at the height of her
powers.
The Cambridge Companion to Margaret Atwood Jun 11 2022
Margaret Atwood's international celebrity has given a new visibility to
Canadian literature in English. This Companion provides a
comprehensive critical account of Atwood's writing across the wide
range of genres within which she has worked for the past forty years,
while paying attention to her Canadian cultural context and the
multiple dimensions of her celebrity. The main concern is with Atwood
the writer, but there is also Atwood the media star and public
performer, cultural critic, environmentalist and human rights
spokeswoman, social and political satirist, and mythmaker. This
immensely varied profile is addressed in a series of chapters which
cover biographical, textual, and contextual issues. The Introduction
contains an analysis of dominant trends in Atwood criticism since the
1970s, while the essays by twelve leading international Atwood critics
represent the wide range of different perspectives in current Atwood
scholarship.
Mr. Splitfoot Mar 21 2023 The strange odysseys of two young women
animate this “hypnotic and glowing” American gothic novel that blurs
the line between the real and the supernatural (Gregory Maguire, The
New York Times Book Review). A New York Times Editors’ Choice A
Paris Review Staff Pick Ruth and Nat are seventeen. They are orphans
living at The Love of Christ! Foster Home in upstate New York. And
they may be able to talk to the dead. Enter Mr. Bell, a con man with
mystical interests who knows an opportunity when he sees one.
Together they embark on an unexpected journey that connects meteor
sites, utopian communities, lost mothers, and a scar that maps its way
across Ruth’s face. Decades later, Ruth visits her niece, Cora. But
while Ruth used to speak to the dead, she now doesn’t speak at all.
Even so, she leads Cora on a mysterious mission that involves crossing
the entire state of New York on foot. Where is she taking them? And
who—or what—is hidden in the woods at the end of the road? “[A]
gripping novel…The narratives, which twist together into a shocking
dénouement, are marked by ghost stories.”—The New Yorker
The Sisters of Reckoning Jan 24 2021 The Sisters of Reckoning is the
blockbuster sequel to Charlotte Nicole Davis's alternate Old West-set

fantasy adventure. The Good Luck Girls are free. Aster's sister and
friends have new lives across the border in Ferron, while Aster
remains in Arketta, helping more girls escape. But news of a new
welcome house opening fills Aster with a need to do more than just
help individual girls. And an unexpected reunion gives her an idea of
how to do it. From there, grows a wildly ambitious plan to free all
dustbloods, who live as prisoners to Arketta's landmasters and debt
slavery. When Clementine and the others return from Ferron, they
become the heart of a vibrant group of fearless fighters, working to
unite the various underclasses and convince them to join in the fight.
Along the way, friendships will be forged, lives will be lost, and love
will take root even in the harshest of circumstances, between the most
unexpected of lovers. But will Arketta's dustbloods finally come into
power and freedom, or will the resistance just open them up to a new
sort of danger? At the Publisher's request, this title is being sold
without Digital Rights Management Software (DRM) applied.
The Cambridge Companion to Alice Munro Oct 16 2022 This
Companion is a thorough introduction to the writings of the Nobel
Prize winner Alice Munro. Uniting the talents of distinguished creative
writers and noted academics, David Staines has put together a
comprehensive, exploratory account of Munro's biography, her
position as a feminist, her evocation of life in small-town Ontario, her
non-fictional writings as well as her short stories, and her artistic
achievement. Considering a wide range of topics – including Munro's
style, life writing, her personal development, and her use of Greek
myths, Celtic ballads, Norse sagas, and popular songs – this volume
will appeal to keen readers of Munro's fiction as well as students and
scholars of literature and Canadian and gender studies.
The Robber Bride Aug 26 2023 From the bestselling author of The
Handmaid's Tale and The Testaments—one of Margaret Atwood’s most
unforgettable characters lurks at the center of this intricate novel like
a spider in a web. The glamorous, irresistible, unscrupulous Zenia is
nothing less than a fairy-tale villain in the memories of her former
friends. Roz, Charis, and Tony—university classmates decades
ago—were reunited at Zenia’s funeral and have met monthly for lunch
ever since, obsessively retracing the destructive swath she once cut
through their lives. A brilliantly inventive fabulist, Zenia had a talent
for exploiting her friends’ weaknesses, wielding intimacy as a weapon
and cheating them of money, time, sympathy, and men. But one day,
five years after her funeral, they are shocked to catch sight of Zenia:
even her death appears to have been yet another fiction. As the three
women plot to confront their larger-than-life nemesis, Atwood proves
herself a gleefully acute observer of the treacherous shoals of
friendship, trust, desire, and power.
Murder in the Dark May 23 2023 First published in 1983, Murder in
the Dark is Margaret Atwood's seventh work of fiction or her tenth
book of poetry, depending on how you slice it. These short prose forms
range from fictionalized autobiography through prose-poetry, mini-
romance, and mini–science fiction. A feast of comic entertainment,
Murder in the Dark is Atwood at her wittiest, most thoughtful, and
most provoking.

Wilderness Tips Sep 26 2023 From the #1 New York Times bestselling
author of The Handmaid's Tale In each of these tales Margaret Atwood
deftly illuminates the shape of a whole life: in a few brief pages we
watch as characters progress from the vulnerabilities of adolescence
through the passions of youth into the precarious complexities of
middle age. The past resurfaces in the present in ways both subtle and
dramatic: the body of a lost Arctic explorer emerges from the ice, a
2,000-year-old bog man turns up in an archeological dig, a man with
dark secrets marries his lover’s sister, a girl who disappears on a
canoe trip haunts her friend many decades later. The richly layered
stories in Wilderness Tips map interior landscapes shaped by time,
regret, and lost chances, endowing even the most unassuming of lives
with a disquieting intensity.
An Experiment in Love Sep 02 2021 A New York Times Book Review
Notable Book of the Year It was the year after Chappaquiddick, and all
spring Carmel McBain had watery dreams about the disaster. Now
she, Karina, and Julianne were escaping the dreary English
countryside for a London University hall of residence. Interspersing
accounts of her current position as a university student with
recollections of her childhood and an ever difficult relationship with
her longtime schoolmate Karina, Carmel reflects on a generation of
girls desiring the power of men, but fearful of abandoning what is
expected and proper. When these bright but confused young women
land in late 1960s London, they are confronted with a slew of new
preoccupations--sex, politics, food, and fertility--and a pointless
grotesque tragedy of their own. Hilary Mantel's magnificent novel
examines the pressures on women during the early days of
contemporary feminism to excel--but not be too successful--in
England's complex hierarchy of class and status.
What Girls Are Made Of Feb 05 2022 A 2017 National Book Award
for Young People's Literature Finalist When Nina Faye was fourteen,
her mother told her there was no such thing as unconditional love.
Nina believed her. Now she'll do anything for the boy she loves, to
prove she's worthy of him. But when he breaks up with her, Nina is
lost. What is she if not a girlfriend? What is she made of? Broken-
hearted, Nina tries to figure out what the conditions of love are.
"Finally, finally, a book that is fully girl, with all of the gore and grace
of growing up female exposed." —Carrie Mesrobian, author of the
William C. Morris finalist, Sex & Violence
Margaret Atwood May 11 2022 Studie over het werk van de
Canadese schrijfster (geb. 1939)
The Handmaid's Tale Nov 16 2022 An instant classic and eerily
prescient cultural phenomenon, from “the patron saint of feminist
dystopian fiction” (New York Times). Now an award-winning Hulu
series starring Elizabeth Moss. In this multi-award-winning,
bestselling novel, Margaret Atwood has created a stunning Orwellian
vision of the near future. This is the story of Offred, one of the
unfortunate “Handmaids” under the new social order who have only
one purpose: to breed. In Gilead, where women are prohibited from
holding jobs, reading, and forming friendships, Offred’s persistent
memories of life in the “time before” and her will to survive are acts of
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rebellion. Provocative, startling, prophetic, and with Margaret
Atwood’s devastating irony, wit, and acute perceptive powers in full
force, The Handmaid’s Tale is at once a mordant satire and a dire
warning.
Alias Grace Jan 07 2022 The bestselling author of The Handmaid's
Tale and The Testaments reveals the life of one of the most notorious
women of the nineteenth century in this "shadowy, fascinating novel"
(Time). • A Netflix original miniseries. It's 1843, and Grace Marks has
been convicted for her involvement in the vicious murders of her
employer and his housekeeper and mistress. Some believe Grace is
innocent; others think her evil or insane. Now serving a life sentence,
Grace claims to have no memory of the murders. An up-and-coming
expert in the burgeoning field of mental illness is engaged by a group
of reformers and spiritualists who seek a pardon for Grace. He listens
to her story while bringing her closer and closer to the day she cannot
remember. What will he find in attempting to unlock her memories?
Captivating and disturbing, Alias Grace showcases bestselling, Booker
Prize-winning author Margaret Atwood at the peak of her powers.
Moral Disorder Apr 21 2023 In these ten dazzling interrelated stories
Atwood traces the course of a life and also the lives intertwined with
it, while evoking the drama and the humour that colour common
experiences—the birth of a baby, divorce and remarriage, old age and
death. With settings ranging from Toronto, northern Quebec, and rural
Ontario, the stories begin in the present, as a couple no longer young
situate themselves in a larger world no longer safe. Then the narrative
goes back in time to the forties and moves chronologically forward
toward the present. In “The Art of Cooking and Serving,” the twelve-
year-old narrator does her best to accommodate the arrival of a baby
sister. After she boldly declares her independence, we follow the
narrator into young adulthood and then through a complex
relationship. In “The Entities,” the story of two women haunted by the
past unfolds. The magnificent last two stories reveal the heartbreaking
old age of parents but circle back again to childhood, to complete the
cycle. By turns funny, lyrical, incisive, tragic, earthy, shocking, and
deeply personal, Moral Disorder displays Atwood’s celebrated
storytelling gifts and unmistakable style to their best advantage. This
is vintage Atwood, writing at the height of her powers.
The Testaments Jun 23 2023 NEW YORK TIMES BESTSELLER •
WINNER OF THE BOOKER PRIZE • A modern masterpiece that
"reminds us of the power of truth in the face of evil” (People)—and can
be read on its own or as a sequel to Margaret Atwood’s classic, The
Handmaid’s Tale. “Atwood’s powers are on full display” (Los Angeles
Times) in this deeply compelling Booker Prize-winning novel, now
updated with additional content that explores the historical sources,
ideas, and material that inspired Atwood. More than fifteen years after
the events of The Handmaid's Tale, the theocratic regime of the
Republic of Gilead maintains its grip on power, but there are signs it is
beginning to rot from within. At this crucial moment, the lives of three
radically different women converge, with potentially explosive results.
Two have grown up as part of the first generation to come of age in
the new order. The testimonies of these two young women are joined

by a third: Aunt Lydia. Her complex past and uncertain future unfold
in surprising and pivotal ways. With The Testaments, Margaret
Atwood opens up the innermost workings of Gilead, as each woman is
forced to come to terms with who she is, and how far she will go for
what she believes.
Old Babes in the Wood Feb 17 2023 NATIONAL BESTSELLER • From
the bestselling, award-winning author of The Handmaid's Tale and The
Testaments, a dazzling collection of short stories that look deeply into
the heart of family relationships, marriage, loss and memory, and what
it means to spend a life together "If you consider yourself an Atwood
fan and have only read her novels: Get your act together. You’ve been
missing out.” —The New York Times Book Review, Rebecca Makkai,
best-selling author of The Great Believers Margaret Atwood has
established herself as one of the most visionary and canonical authors
in the world. This collection of fifteen extraordinary stories—some of
which have appeared in The New Yorker and The New York Times
Magazine—explore the full warp and weft of experience, speaking to
our unique times with Atwood’s characteristic insight, wit and
intellect. The two intrepid sisters of the title story grapple with loss
and memory on a perfect summer evening; “Impatient Griselda”
explores alienation and miscommunication with a fresh twist on a
folkloric classic; and “My Evil Mother” touches on the fantastical,
examining a mother-daughter relationship in which the mother
purports to be a witch. At the heart of the collection are seven
extraordinary stories that follow a married couple across the decades,
the moments big and small that make up a long life of uncommon
love—and what comes after. Returning to short fiction for the first
time since her 2014 collection Stone Mattress, Atwood showcases both
her creativity and her humanity in these remarkable tales which by
turns delight, illuminate, and quietly devastate.
The Pleasure of Reading Jan 31 2024 In this delightful collection,
forty acclaimed writers explain what first made them interested in
literature, what inspired them to read, and what makes them continue
to do so. First published in 1992 in hardback only, original
contributors include Margaret Atwood, J. G. Ballard, Melvyn Bragg, A.
S. Byatt, Catherine Cookson, Carol Ann Duffy, Germaine Greer, Alan
Hollinghurst, Doris Lessing, Candia McWilliam, Edna O'Brien, Ruth
Rendell, Tom Stoppard, Sue Townsend, and Jeanette Winterson. The
new edition will include essays from ten new writers.
Oryx and Crake Jul 13 2022 A stunning and provocative new novel by
the internationally celebrated author of The Blind Assassin, winner of
the Booker Prize. Margaret Atwood’s new novel is so utterly
compelling, so prescient, so relevant, so terrifyingly-all-too-likely-to-be-
true, that readers may find their view of the world forever changed
after reading it. This is Margaret Atwood at the absolute peak of her
powers. For readers of Oryx and Crake, nothing will ever look the
same again. The narrator of Atwood's riveting novel calls himself
Snowman. When the story opens, he is sleeping in a tree, wearing an
old bedsheet, mourning the loss of his beloved Oryx and his best friend
Crake, and slowly starving to death. He searches for supplies in a
wasteland where insects proliferate and pigoons and wolvogs ravage

the pleeblands, where ordinary people once lived, and the Compounds
that sheltered the extraordinary. As he tries to piece together what
has taken place, the narrative shifts to decades earlier. How did
everything fall apart so quickly? Why is he left with nothing but his
haunting memories? Alone except for the green-eyed Children of
Crake, who think of him as a kind of monster, he explores the answers
to these questions in the double journey he takes - into his own past,
and back to Crake's high-tech bubble-dome, where the Paradice
Project unfolded and the world came to grief. With breathtaking
command of her shocking material, and with her customary sharp wit
and dark humour, Atwood projects us into an outlandish yet wholly
believable realm populated by characters who will continue to inhabit
our dreams long after the last chapter.
The Secret Loves of Geek Girls: Expanded Edition Mar 01 2024
The Secret Loves of Geek Girls is a non-fiction anthology mixing prose,
comics, and illustrated stories on the lives and loves of an amazing
cast of female creators. Featuring work by Margaret Atwood (The
Heart Goes Last), Mariko Tamaki (This One Summer), Trina Robbins
(Wonder Woman), Marguerite Bennett (Marvel's A-Force), Noelle
Stevenson (Nimona), Marjorie Liu (Monstress), Carla Speed McNeil
(Finder), and over fifty more creators. It's a compilation of tales told
from both sides of the tables: from the fans who love video games,
comics, and sci-fi to those that work behind the scenes: creators and
industry insiders.
The Secret Loves of Geek Girls: Expanded Edition Dec 30 2023 The
Secret Loves of Geek Girls is a non-fiction anthology mixing prose,
comics, and illustrated stories on the lives and loves of an amazing
cast of female creators. Featuring work by Margaret Atwood (The
Heart Goes Last), Mariko Tamaki (This One Summer), Trina Robbins
(Wonder Woman), Marguerite Bennett (Marvel's A-Force), Noelle
Stevenson (Nimona), Marjorie Liu (Monstress), Carla Speed McNeil
(Finder), and over fifty more creators. It's a compilation of tales told
from both sides of the tables: from the fans who love video games,
comics, and sci-fi to those that work behind the scenes: creators and
industry insiders.
Dancing Girls and Other Stories May 03 2024 This splendid volume of
short fiction testifies to Margaret Atwood's startlingly original voice,
full of a rare intensity and exceptional intelligence. Her men and
women still miscommunicate, still remain separate in different rooms,
different houses, or even different worlds. With brilliant flashes of
fantasy, humor, and unexpected violence, the stories reveal the
complexities of human relationships and bring to life characters who
touch us deeply, evoking terror and laughter, compassion and
recognition--and dramatically demonstrate why Margaret Atwood is
one of the most important writers in English today. Copyright © Libri
GmbH. All rights reserved.
Never Let Me Go Feb 25 2021 NOBEL PRIZE WINNER • The moving,
suspenseful, beautifully atmospheric modern classic from the
acclaimed author of The Remains of the Day and Klara and the
Sun—“a Gothic tour de force" (The New York Times) with an
extraordinary twist. “Brilliantly executed.” —Margaret Atwood “A
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page-turner and a heartbreaker.” —TIME “Masterly.” —Sunday Times
As children, Kathy, Ruth, and Tommy were students at Hailsham, an
exclusive boarding school secluded in the English countryside. It was a
place of mercurial cliques and mysterious rules where teachers were
constantly reminding their charges of how special they were. Now,
years later, Kathy is a young woman. Ruth and Tommy have reentered
her life. And for the first time she is beginning to look back at their
shared past and understand just what it is that makes them
special—and how that gift will shape the rest of their time together.
There are Girls like Lions Nov 04 2021 An anthology of poems about
the experience of being a woman With 30 rousing and empowering
poems: For mothers, daughters, sisters, wives, partners, and friends,
There Are Girls Like Lions is a celebration of womanhood in all its
dimensions, including love, beauty, friendship, motherhood, work,
aging, and much more. This powerful collection of poems will resonate
with any modern woman. • Foreword by award-winning American poet
Cole Swensen who has authored more than ten books of poetry •
Striking illustrations in metallic ink throughout • With poems from a
variety of women poets including Margaret Atwood, Edna St. Vincent
Millay, Kimiko Hahn, Elisabeth Hewer, Rachel Zucker, Emily
Dickinson, Naomi Shihab Nye, and more Fans of the novel An
American Marriage, The Future is Feminist, and Women of Resistance
will be inspired and empowered by There are Girls Like Lions.
Discover 30 poems that honor and celebrate the experience of being a
woman. • Packaged in an attractive case with foil stamping ready to
give or receive • Great Mother's Day, birthday, or anytime gift for the
strong women in your life
The Good Luck Girls Aug 14 2022 An Indie Next Pick A Silver 2019
Nautilus Book Award Winner A Kirkus Reviews 2019 Best of the Year
Selection Westworld meets The Handmaid’s Tale in this stunning
fantasy adventure from debut author Charlotte Nicole Davis. Aster, the
protector Violet, the favorite Tansy, the medic Mallow, the fighter
Clementine, the catalyst THE GOOD LUCK GIRLS The country of
Arketta calls them Good Luck Girls—they know their luck is anything
but. Sold to a “welcome house” as children and branded with cursed
markings. Trapped in a life they would never have chosen. When
Clementine accidentally kills a man, the girls risk a dangerous escape
and harrowing journey to find freedom, justice, and revenge in a
country that wants them to have none of those things. Pursued by
Arketta’s most vicious and powerful forces, both human and inhuman,
their only hope lies in a bedtime story passed from one Good Luck Girl
to another, a story that only the youngest or most desperate would
ever believe. It’s going to take more than luck for them all to survive.
At the Publisher's request, this title is being sold without Digital Rights

Management Software (DRM) applied.
Margaret Atwood May 30 2021 Although Margaret Atwood has been
the subject of a great deal of literary criticism and commentary, this is
the first biography of the celebrated author, poet, critic, and social
activist whose critically and popularly acclaimed works include
Surfacing, Cat's Eye, The Handmaid's Tale, and Alias Grace. The
Atwood who emerges in these pages is an intense and driven woman,
struggling daily to balance the demands of her own artistic
perfectionism with her commitment to enjoying a rich and varied
private life. Nathalie Cooke (a former president of the Margaret
Atwood Society) traces an astonishing network of interconnections
that weaves its way through Atwood's past and present: friends,
lovers, wives, and husbands who become each others' publishers,
editors, promoters, and critics. Cooke follows the web, and along the
way discloses some of Atwood's most painful and personal moments,
including broken engagements, betrayals, and divorce. This biography
follows Atwood's development as a major figure in the evolution of
contemporary Canadian literature and culture, and at the same time
chronicles the reception of her works and her own ongoing creation of
her public persona.
Bluebeard's Egg Oct 28 2023 By turns humorous and warm, stark
and frightening, Bluebeard's Egg infuses a Canada of the 1940s, '50s
and '80s with glowing childhood memories, the harsh realities of
parents growing old, and the casual cruelty that men and women
inflict on each other. Here is the familiar outer world of family
summers at remote lakes, winters of political activism, and seasons of
exotic friends, mudane lives and unexpected loves. But here too is the
inner world of hidden places and all that emerges from them—the
intimately personal, the fantastic and the shockingly real...whether it's
what lies in a mysterious locked room or in the secret feelings we all
conceal.
Dearly Aug 02 2021 A new book of poetry from internationally
acclaimed, award-winning and bestselling author Margaret Atwood In
Dearly, Margaret Atwood’s first collection of poetry in over a decade,
Atwood addresses themes such as love, loss, the passage of time, the
nature of nature and - zombies. Her new poetry is introspective and
personal in tone, but wide-ranging in topic. In poem after poem, she
casts her unique imagination and unyielding, observant eye over the
landscape of a life carefully and intuitively lived. While many are
familiar with Margaret Atwood’s fiction—including her
groundbreaking and bestselling novels The Handmaid’s Tale, The
Testaments, Oryx and Crake, among others—she has, from the
beginning of her career, been one of our most significant
contemporary poets. And she is one of the very few writers equally

accomplished in fiction and poetry. This collection is a stunning
achievement that will be appreciated by fans of her novels and poetry
readers alike.
Dancing Girls Jun 04 2024 A splendid collection of short stories from
the author of the New York Times bestselling novel The Handmaid’s
Tale—the inspiration behind the award-winning Hulu original series.
Margaret Atwood brings her singular voice to this unforgettable
volume of short stories filled with rare intensity and exceptional
intelligence. With brilliant flashes of fantasy, humor, and unexpected
violence, the stories reveal the complexities of human relationships
and bring to life characters who touch us deeply, evoking terror,
laughter, compassion and recognition—and dramatically demonstrate
why Margaret Atwood is one of the most important writers in English
today.
The Heart Goes Last Sep 14 2022 From the bestselling author of The
Handmaid's Tale and The Testaments—in the gated community of
Consilience, residents who sign a contract will get a job and a lovely
house for six months of the year...if they serve as inmates in the
Positron prison system for the alternate months.
“Captivating...thrilling.” —The New York Times Book Review Stan and
Charmaine, a young urban couple, have been hit by job loss and
bankruptcy in the midst of nationwide economic collapse. Forced to
live in their third-hand Honda, where they are vulnerable to roving
gangs, they think the gated community of Consilience may be the
answer to their prayers. At first, this seems worth it: they will have a
roof over their heads and food on the table. But when a series of
troubling events unfolds, Positron begins to look less like a prayer
answered and more like a chilling prophecy fulfilled. The Heart Goes
Last is a vivid, urgent vision of development and decay, freedom and
surveillance, struggle and hope—and the timeless workings of the
human heart.
The Secret Loves of Geeks Jan 19 2023 Following the smash-hit The
Secret Loves of Geek Girls comes this brand new anthology featuring
comic and prose stories from cartoonists and professional geeks about
their most intimate, heartbreaking, and inspiring tales of love, sex and,
dating. Including creators of all genders, orientations, and cultural
backgrounds. Featuring work by MARGARET ATWOOD (The
Handmaid's Tale), GERARD WAY (Umbrella Academy), PATRICK
ROTHFUSS (The Name of the Wind), DANA SIMPSON (Phoebe and
Her Unicorn), GABBY RIVERA (America), HOPE LARSON, (Batgirl),
CECIL CASTELLUCCI (Soupy Leaves Home), VALENTINE DE
LANDRO (Bitch Planet), MARLEY ZARCONE (Shade), SFÉ R.
MONSTER (Beyond: A queer comics anthology), AMY CHU (Wonder
Woman), a cover by BECKY CLOONAN (Demo) and many more.
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