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"This book offers a hands-on introduction and teaching resource for students, users, and teachers of Qualitative Comparative Analysis (QCA; Ragin,
1987, 2000, 2008b). Given its superior ability to model certain aspects of complexity, QCA has made inroads into virtually every social science
discipline and beyond. Software solutions for QCA have also been developing at a fast pace. This book seeks to reduce the time and effort required
when we first encounter the logic of not just a new method but also new software. It offers a genuinely simple, intuitive, and hands-on resource for
implementing the state-of-the-art protocol of QCA using R, the most advanced software environment for QCA. Our book has an applied and practical
focus"-- bookdown: Authoring Books and Technical Documents with R Markdown presents a much easier way to write books and technical
publications than traditional tools such as LaTeX and Word. The bookdown package inherits the simplicity of syntax and flexibility for data analysis
from R Markdown, and extends R Markdown for technical writing, so that you can make better use of document elements such as figures, tables,
equations, theorems, citations, and references. Similar to LaTeX, you can number and cross-reference these elements with bookdown. Your document
can even include live examples so readers can interact with them while reading the book. The book can be rendered to multiple output formats,
including LaTeX/PDF, HTML, EPUB, and Word, thus making it easy to put your documents online. The style and theme of these output formats can
be customized. We used books and R primarily for examples in this book, but bookdown is not only for books or R. Most features introduced in this
book also apply to other types of publications: journal papers, reports, dissertations, course handouts, study notes, and even novels. You do not have to
use R, either. Other choices of computing languages include Python, C, C++, SQL, Bash, Stan, JavaScript, and so on, although R is best supported.
You can also leave out computing, for example, to write a fiction. This book itself is an example of publishing with bookdown and R Markdown, and
its source is fully available on GitHub. This book provides an introduction to the statistical software R and its application with an empirical approach in
finance and economics. It is specifically targeted towards undergraduate and graduate students. It provides beginner-level introduction to R using
RStudio and reproducible research examples. It will enable students to use R for data cleaning, data visualization and quantitative model building using
statistical methods like linear regression, econometrics (GARCH etc), Copulas, etc. Moreover, the book demonstrates latest research methods with
applications featuring linear regression, quantile regression, panel regression, econometrics, dependence modelling, etc. using a range of data sets and
examples. Request Inspection Copy An Essential Reference for Intermediate and Advanced R Programmers Advanced R presents useful tools and
techniques for attacking many types of R programming problems, helping you avoid mistakes and dead ends. With more than ten years of experience
programming in R, the author illustrates the elegance, beauty, and flexibility at the heart of R. The book develops the necessary skills to produce
quality code that can be used in a variety of circumstances. You will learn: The fundamentals of R, including standard data types and functions
Functional programming as a useful framework for solving wide classes of problems The positives and negatives of metaprogramming How to write
fast, memory-efficient code This book not only helps current R users become R programmers but also shows existing programmers what’s special
about R. Intermediate R programmers can dive deeper into R and learn new strategies for solving diverse problems while programmers from other
languages can learn the details of R and understand why R works the way it does. This free software guide for R with freely downloadable datasets
brings the econometric techniques to life, showing readers how to implement the approaches presented in Introductory Econometrics for Finance using
this highly popular software package. Designed to be used alongside the main textbook, the guide will give readers the confidence and skills to
estimate and interpret their own models while the textbook will ensure that they have a thorough understanding of the conceptual underpinnings.
***Choice Outstanding Academic Title Award Winner*** The dynamic, student focused textbook provides step-by-step instruction in the use of R
and of statistical language as a general research tool. It is ideal for anyone hoping to: Complete an introductory course in statistics Prepare for more
advanced statistical courses Gain the transferable analytical skills needed to interpret research from across the social sciences Learn the technical skills
needed to present data visually Acquire a basic competence in the use of R. The book provides readers with the conceptual foundation to use applied
statistical methods in everyday research. Each statistical method is developed within the context of practical, real-world examples and is supported by
carefully developed pedagogy and jargon-free definitions. Theory is introduced as an accessible and adaptable tool and is always contextualized within
the pragmatic context of real research projects and definable research questions. Author Robert Stinerock has also created a wide range of online
resources, including: R scripts, complete solutions for all exercises, data files for each chapter, video and screen casts, and interactive multiple-choice
quizzes. R is a statistical computer program used and developed by statisticians around the world. It is probably the leading statistical program, at least
among statisticians, and it is freely available. A First Guide to Statistical Computations in R is intended for the newcomer who wants to do statistical
analysis with R and needs a guide to get started. The book focuses on statistical data problems that are often encountered within the biosceinces. It puts
special emphasis on linear models and analysis of repeated measurements data, but also deals with binary data and survival data, among others.
Problems are presented and solutions - along with the corresponding OR code and output - are provided. The guide is divided into two parts: the first
part on R basics and the second part on the statistical analyses using R. Various datasets are used for illustration and they are all available in the R
package Guide1data. Learn how to perform data analysis with the R language and software environment, even if you have little or no programming
experience. With the tutorials in this hands-on guide, you’ll learn how to use the essential R tools you need to know to analyze data, including data
types and programming concepts. The second half of Learning R shows you real data analysis in action by covering everything from importing data to
publishing your results. Each chapter in the book includes a quiz on what you’ve learned, and concludes with exercises, most of which involve writing
R code. Write a simple R program, and discover what the language can do Use data types such as vectors, arrays, lists, data frames, and strings Execute
code conditionally or repeatedly with branches and loops Apply R add-on packages, and package your own work for others Learn how to clean data
you import from a variety of sources Understand data through visualization and summary statistics Use statistical models to pass quantitative
judgments about data and make predictions Learn what to do when things go wrong while writing data analysis code This step-by-step guide is written
for R and latent variable model (LVM) novices. Utilizing a path model approach and focusing on the lavaan package, this book is designed to help
readers quickly understand LVMs and their analysis in R. The author reviews the reasoning behind the syntax selected and provides examples that



demonstrate how to analyze data for a variety of LVMs. Featuring examples applicable to psychology, education, business, and other social and health
sciences, minimal text is devoted to theoretical underpinnings. The material is presented without the use of matrix algebra. As a whole the book
prepares readers to write about and interpret LVM results they obtain in R. Each chapter features background information, boldfaced key terms defined
in the glossary, detailed interpretations of R output, descriptions of how to write the analysis of results for publication, a summary, R based practice
exercises (with solutions included in the back of the book), and references and related readings. Margin notes help readers better understand LVMs and
write their own R syntax. Examples using data from published work across a variety of disciplines demonstrate how to use R syntax for analyzing and
interpreting results. R functions, syntax, and the corresponding results appear in gray boxes to help readers quickly locate this material. A unique index
helps readers quickly locate R functions, packages, and datasets. The book and accompanying website at http://blogs.baylor.edu/rlatentvariable/
provides all of the data for the book’s examples and exercises as well as R syntax so readers can replicate the analyses. The book reviews how to enter
the data into R, specify the LVMs, and obtain and interpret the estimated parameter values. The book opens with the fundamentals of using R including
how to download the program, use functions, and enter and manipulate data. Chapters 2 and 3 introduce and then extend path models to include latent
variables. Chapter 4 shows readers how to analyze a latent variable model with data from more than one group, while Chapter 5 shows how to analyze
a latent variable model with data from more than one time period. Chapter 6 demonstrates the analysis of dichotomous variables, while Chapter 7
demonstrates how to analyze LVMs with missing data. Chapter 8 focuses on sample size determination using Monte Carlo methods, which can be used
with a wide range of statistical models and account for missing data. The final chapter examines hierarchical LVMs, demonstrating both higher-order
and bi-factor approaches. The book concludes with three Appendices: a review of common measures of model fit including their formulae and
interpretation; syntax for other R latent variable models packages; and solutions for each chapter’s exercises. Intended as a supplementary text for
graduate and/or advanced undergraduate courses on latent variable modeling, factor analysis, structural equation modeling, item response theory,
measurement, or multivariate statistics taught in psychology, education, human development, business, economics, and social and health sciences, this
book also appeals to researchers in these fields. Prerequisites include familiarity with basic statistical concepts, but knowledge of R is not assumed. R
programming is an efficient tool for statistical analysis of data. Data science has become critical to each field and the popularity of R is skyrocketing.
Organization as large and diverse as Google, Facebook, Microsoft, Bank of America, Ford Motor Company, Mozilla, Thomas Cook, The New York
Times, The National Weather Service, Twitter, ANZ Bank, Uber, Airbnb etc . have turned to R for reporting, analyzing and visualization of data, this
book is for students and professionals of Mathematics, Statistics, Physics, Chemistry, Biology, Social Science and Medicine, Business, Engineering,
Software, Information Technology, Sales, Bio Informatics, Pharmacy and any one, where data needs to be analyzed and represented graphically.
Drawing on real world data to showcase different techniques, this practical book helps you use R for data analysis in your own research. A
Criminologist's Guide to R: Crime by the Numbers introduces the programming language R and covers the necessary skills to conduct quantitative
research in criminology. By the end of this book, a person without any prior programming experience can take raw crime data, be able to clean it,
visualize the data, present it using R Markdown, and change it to a format ready for analysis. A Criminologist's Guide to R focuses on skills
specifically for criminology such as spatial joins, mapping, and scraping data from PDFs, however any social scientist looking for an introduction to R
for data analysis will find this useful. Key Features: Introduction to RStudio including how to change user preference settings. Basic data exploration
and cleaning – subsetting, loading data, regular expressions, aggregating data. Graphing with ggplot2. How to make maps (hotspot maps, choropleth
maps, interactive maps). Webscraping and PDF scraping. Project management – how to prepare for a project, how to decide which projects to do, best
ways to collaborate with people, how to store your code (using git), and how to test your code. R is a programming language and software environment
for statistical analysis, graphics representation, and reporting. If you are trying to understand the R programming language as a beginner, this short
book will give you enough understanding of almost all the concepts of the R language. The author will guide you through examples, how to program in
R and how to use R for effective data analysis.Buy your copy Now! Book ObjectivesThis book is about R programming. The following are the
objectives of the author: To familiarize you with the basics of R programming language. To help you understand the various fields where R can be
applied and its use cases in each field. To equip you with R programming skills, both beginner and advanced skills. To introduce you to R
programming for data analysis. To introduce you to R programming for machine learning. To help you understand and appreciate the power of R in
statistical computing, data analysis, and scientific research. Who this Book is for? Anybody who is a complete beginner to R Programming. Anybody
in need of advancing their R Programming skills. Professionals in computer programming. Professors, lecturers or tutors who are looking to find better
ways to explain R programming to their students in the simplest and easiest way. Students and academicians, especially those focusing on R, Data
Analysis, Machine Learning, computer science, and Databases development. RequirementsThe author expects you to have a computer installed with an
operating system such as Linux, Windows or Mac OS X. What is inside the book? R BASICS R DATA TYPES R VARIABLES AND CONSTANTS
R OPERATORS DECISION MAKING IN R R LOOPS R FUNCTIONS R CLASSES AND OBJECTS R FOR DATA SCIENCE R FOR MACHINE
LEARNING From the Back Cover.R programming language is one of the most popular languages used by statisticians, data analysts, researchers to
retrieve, clean, analyze, visualize and present data. This is a comprehensive book on how to get started with R programming, why you should learn it
and how you can learn it. Daniel Bell begins by introducing the readers to the foundations of the R programming language. The aim is to help you
understand, how the R interpreter works, the origin of the name R, how to set up the R programming environment, etc. The author has discussed the
process of installing R on Windows, Linux and Mac OS. Moreover, the author has explored the basics of R programming including writing comments,
using the R console, creating R script files, etc. The various features provided by R have been discussed in depth, including data types, variables, loops,
decision making, functions, operators, classes, and objects, etc. The author has also discussed R for data science and R for machine learning. The book
has been organized into chapters, with each chapter having many sub-chapters. R code scripts have been provided, alongside thorough explanations of
the code and images showing the expected output upon the execution of every script. R is now the most widely used statistical software in academic
science and it is rapidly expanding into other fields such as finance. R is almost limitlessly flexible and powerful, hence its appeal, but can be very
difficult for the novice user. There are no easy pull-down menus, error messages are often cryptic and simple tasks like importing your data or
exporting a graph can be difficult and frustrating. Introductory R is written for the novice user who knows a little about statistics but who hasn't yet got
to grips with the ways of R. This new edition is completely revised and greatly expanded with new chapters on the basics of descriptive statistics and
statistical testing, considerably more information on statistics and six new chapters on programming in R. Topics covered include: A walkthrough of
the basics of R's command line interface Data structures including vectors, matrices and data frames R functions and how to use them Expanding your
analysis and plotting capacities with add-in R packages A set of simple rules to follow to make sure you import your data properly An introduction to
the script editor and advice on workflow A detailed introduction to drawing publication-standard graphs in R How to understand the help files and how
to deal with some of the most common errors that you might encounter. Basic descriptive statistics The theory behind statistical testing and how to
interpret the output of statistical tests Thorough coverage of the basics of data analysis in R with chapters on using chi-squared tests, t-tests, correlation
analysis, regression, ANOVA and general linear models What the assumptions behind the analyses mean and how to test them using diagnostic plots
Explanations of the summary tables produced for statistical analyses such as regression and ANOVA Writing your own functions in R Using table
operations to manipulate matrices and data frames Using conditional statements and loops in R programmes. Writing longer R programmes. The
techniques of statistical analysis in R are illustrated by a series of chapters where experimental and survey data are analysed. There is a strong
emphasis on using real data from real scientific research, with all the problems and uncertainty that implies, rather than well-behaved made-up data
that give ideal and easy to analyse results. Here is a thorough and authoritative guide to the latest version of the S language and its programming
environment. Programming With Data describes a new and greatly extended version of S, written by the chief designer of the language itself. It is a



guide to the complete programming process, starting from simple, interactive use, and continuing through ambitious software projects. The focus is on
the needs of the programmer/user, with the aim of turning ideas into software, quickly and faithfully. The new version of S provides a powerful
class/method structure, new techniques to deal with large objects, extended interfaces to other languages and files, object-based documentation
compatible with HTML, and powerful new interactive programming techniques. This version of S underlies the S-Plus system, versions 5.0 and higher.
Learn how to use R to turn raw data into insight, knowledge, and understanding. This book introduces you to R, RStudio, and the tidyverse, a
collection of R packages designed to work together to make data science fast, fluent, and fun. Suitable for readers with no previous programming
experience, R for Data Science is designed to get you doing data science as quickly as possible. Authors Hadley Wickham and Garrett Grolemund
guide you through the steps of importing, wrangling, exploring, and modeling your data and communicating the results. You'll get a complete, big-
picture understanding of the data science cycle, along with basic tools you need to manage the details. Each section of the book is paired with exercises
to help you practice what you've learned along the way. You'll learn how to: Wrangle—transform your datasets into a form convenient for analysis
Program—learn powerful R tools for solving data problems with greater clarity and ease Explore—examine your data, generate hypotheses, and
quickly test them Model—provide a low-dimensional summary that captures true "signals" in your dataset Communicate—learn R Markdown for
integrating prose, code, and results R Markdown: The Definitive Guide is the first official book authored by the core R Markdown developers that
provides a comprehensive and accurate reference to the R Markdown ecosystem. With R Markdown, you can easily create reproducible data analysis
reports, presentations, dashboards, interactive applications, books, dissertations, websites, and journal articles, while enjoying the simplicity of
Markdown and the great power of R and other languages. In this book, you will learn Basics: Syntax of Markdown and R code chunks, how to
generate figures and tables, and how to use other computing languages Built-in output formats of R Markdown: PDF/HTML/Word/RTF/Markdown
documents and ioslides/Slidy/Beamer/PowerPoint presentations Extensions and applications: Dashboards, Tufte handouts, xaringan/reveal.js
presentations, websites, books, journal articles, and interactive tutorials Advanced topics: Parameterized reports, HTML widgets, document templates,
custom output formats, and Shiny documents. Yihui Xie is a software engineer at RStudio. He has authored and co-authored several R packages,
including knitr, rmarkdown, bookdown, blogdown, shiny, xaringan, and animation. He has published three other books, Dynamic Documents with R
and knitr, bookdown: Authoring Books and Technical Documents with R Markdown, and blogdown: Creating Websites with R Markdown. J.J. Allaire
is the founder of RStudio and the creator of the RStudio IDE. He is an author of several packages in the R Markdown ecosystem including rmarkdown,
flexdashboard, learnr, and radix. Garrett Grolemund is the co-author of R for Data Science and author of Hands-On Programming with R. He wrote the
lubridate R package and works for RStudio as an advocate who trains engineers to do data science with R and the Tidyverse. R is a programming
language developed is widely used for statistical and graphical analysis. It can execute advance machine learning algorithms including earning
algorithm, linear regression, time series, statistical inference. R programming language is used by Fortune 500 companies and tech bellwethers like
Uber, Google, Airbnb, Facebook, Apple. R provides a data scientist tools and libraries (Dplyr) to perform the 3 steps of analysis 1) Extract 2)
Transform, Cleanse 3) Analyze. Table of Contents Chapter 1: What is R Programming Language? Introduction & Basics Chapter 2: How to Download
& Install R, RStudio, Anaconda on Mac or Windows Chapter 3: R Data Types, Arithmetic & Logical Operators with Example Chapter 4: R Matrix
Tutorial: Create, Print, add Column, Slice Chapter 5: Factor in R: Categorical & Continuous Variables Chapter 6: R Data Frame: Create, Append,
Select, Subset Chapter 7: List in R: Create, Select Elements with Example Chapter 8: R Sort a Data Frame using Order() Chapter 9: R Dplyr Tutorial:
Data Manipulation(Join) & Cleaning(Spread) Chapter 10: Merge Data Frames in R: Full and Partial Match Chapter 11: Functions in R Programming
(with Example) Chapter 12: IF, ELSE, ELSE IF Statement in R Chapter 13: For Loop in R with Examples for List and Matrix Chapter 14: While Loop
in R with Example Chapter 15: apply(), lapply(), sapply(), tapply() Function in R with Examples Chapter 16: Import Data into R: Read CSV, Excel,
SPSS, Stata, SAS Files Chapter 17: How to Replace Missing Values(NA) in R: na.omit & na.rm Chapter 18: R Exporting Data to Excel, CSV, SAS,
STATA, Text File Chapter 19: Correlation in R: Pearson & Spearman with Matrix Example Chapter 20: R Aggregate Function: Summarise &
Group_by() Example Chapter 21: R Select(), Filter(), Arrange(), Pipeline with Example Chapter 22: Scatter Plot in R using ggplot2 (with Example)
Chapter 23: How to make Boxplot in R (with EXAMPLE) Chapter 24: Bar Chart & Histogram in R (with Example) Chapter 25: T Test in R: One
Sample and Paired (with Example) Chapter 26: R ANOVA Tutorial: One way & Two way (with Examples) Chapter 27: R Simple, Multiple Linear and
Stepwise Regression [with Example] Chapter 28: Decision Tree in R with Example Chapter 29: R Random Forest Tutorial with Example Chapter 30:
Generalized Linear Model (GLM) in R with Example Chapter 31: K-means Clustering in R with Example Chapter 32: R Vs Python: What's the
Difference? Chapter 33: SAS vs R: What's the Difference? Geared toward social and behavioural statistics students, especially those with no
background in computer science, this handy guide contains basic information on statistics in the R language. There are many excellent R resources for
visualization, data science, and package development. Hundreds of scattered vignettes, web pages, and forums explain how to use R in particular
domains. But little has been written on how to simply make R work effectively—until now. This hands-on book teaches novices and experienced R
users how to write efficient R code. Drawing on years of experience teaching R courses, authors Colin Gillespie and Robin Lovelace provide practical
advice on a range of topics—from optimizing the set-up of RStudio to leveraging C++—that make this book a useful addition to any R user’s
bookshelf. Academics, business users, and programmers from a wide range of backgrounds stand to benefit from the guidance in Efficient R
Programming. Get advice for setting up an R programming environment Explore general programming concepts and R coding techniques Understand
the ingredients of an efficient R workflow Learn how to efficiently read and write data in R Dive into data carpentry—the vital skill for cleaning raw
data Optimize your code with profiling, standard tricks, and other methods Determine your hardware capabilities for handling R computation
Maximize the benefits of collaborative R programming Accelerate your transition from R hacker to R programmer The Book of R is a comprehensive,
beginner-friendly guide to R, the world’s most popular programming language for statistical analysis. Even if you have no programming experience
and little more than a grounding in the basics of mathematics, you’ll find everything you need to begin using R effectively for statistical analysis.
You’ll start with the basics, like how to handle data and write simple programs, before moving on to more advanced topics, like producing statistical
summaries of your data and performing statistical tests and modeling. You’ll even learn how to create impressive data visualizations with R’s basic
graphics tools and contributed packages, like ggplot2 and ggvis, as well as interactive 3D visualizations using the rgl package. Dozens of hands-on
exercises (with downloadable solutions) take you from theory to practice, as you learn: –The fundamentals of programming in R, including how to
write data frames, create functions, and use variables, statements, and loops –Statistical concepts like exploratory data analysis, probabilities,
hypothesis tests, and regression modeling, and how to execute them in R –How to access R’s thousands of functions, libraries, and data sets –How to
draw valid and useful conclusions from your data –How to create publication-quality graphics of your results Combining detailed explanations with
real-world examples and exercises, this book will provide you with a solid understanding of both statistics and the depth of R’s functionality. Make
The Book of R your doorway into the growing world of data analysis. Focusing on developing practical R skills rather than teaching pure statistics, Dr.
Kurt Taylor Gaubatz’s A Survivor’s Guide to R provides a gentle yet thorough introduction to R. The book is structured around critical R tasks, and
focuses on applied knowledge, rather than abstract concepts. Gaubatz’s easy-to-read approach helps students with little or no background in statistics
or programming to develop real-world R skills through straightforward coverage of R objects and functions. Focusing on real-world data, the
challenges of dataset construction, and the use of R’s powerful graphing tools, the guide is written in an accessible, sympathetic, even humorous style
that ensures students acquire functional R skills they can use in their own projects and carry into their work beyond the classroom. David Busch's
Canon EOS R Guide to Digital Photography is your all-in-one comprehensive resource and reference for the exciting new Canon EOS R full-frame
mirrorless camera. It sports a high-resolution 30 MP sensor embedded with 5,655 Dual-Pixel phase detection AF points for lightning-fast, precise
autofocus. The EOS R’s 3.69 million dot electronic viewfinder provides a bright, clear view. Three available mount adapters make it easy to



supplement your R-mount lenses with a broad selection of legacy Canon EF and EF-S optics. The EOS R has Wi-Fi/ NFC connectivity to allow linking
the camera to a computer and iOS or Android smart devices, high-definition movie-making capabilities, and a versatile swiveling touch screen LCD.
With this book in hand, you can quickly apply all these advanced features to your digital photography, while boosting your creativity to take great
photographs with your Canon EOS R.

Filled with detailed how-to steps and full-color illustrations, David Busch's Canon EOS R Guide to Digital Photography covers all this upscale
camera's features in depth, from taking your first photos through advanced details of setup, exposure, lens selection, lighting, and more, and relates
each feature to specific photographic techniques and situations. Also included is the handy EOS R "roadmap" chapter, an easy-to-use visual guide to
the camera's features and controls. Learn when to use each option and, more importantly, when not to use them, by following the author’s
recommended settings for every menu entry. With best-selling photographer and mentor David Busch as your guide, you'll quickly have full creative
mastery of your camera’s capabilities, whether you're shooting on the job, as an advanced enthusiast, or are just out for fun. Start building your
knowledge and confidence, while bringing your vision to light with the Canon EOS R today. p.p1 {margin: 0.0px 0.0px 0.0px 0.0px; font: 12.0px
'Times New Roman'} p.p2 {margin: 0.0px 0.0px 0.0px 0.0px; font: 12.0px 'Times New Roman'; min-height: 15.0px} span.s1 {font: 11.0px Verdana}
Turn your R code into packages that others can easily download and use. This practical book shows you how to bundle reusable R functions, sample
data, and documentation together by applying author Hadley Wickham’s package development philosophy. In the process, you’ll work with devtools,
roxygen, and testthat, a set of R packages that automate common development tasks. Devtools encapsulates best practices that Hadley has learned from
years of working with this programming language. Ideal for developers, data scientists, and programmers with various backgrounds, this book starts
you with the basics and shows you how to improve your package writing over time. You’ll learn to focus on what you want your package to do, rather
than think about package structure. Learn about the most useful components of an R package, including vignettes and unit tests Automate anything you
can, taking advantage of the years of development experience embodied in devtools Get tips on good style, such as organizing functions into files
Streamline your development process with devtools Learn the best way to submit your package to the Comprehensive R Archive Network (CRAN)
Learn from a well-respected member of the R community who created 30 R packages, including ggplot2, dplyr, and tidyr Based on their extensive
experience with teaching R and statistics to applied scientists, the authors provide a beginner's guide to R. To avoid the difficulty of teaching R and
statistics at the same time, statistical methods are kept to a minimum. The text covers how to download and install R, import and manage data,
elementary plotting, an introduction to functions, advanced plotting, and common beginner mistakes. This book contains everything you need to know
to get started with R. Full of screenshots and examples, this Beginner's Guide by Example will teach you practically everything you need to know
about R statistical application development from scratch. You will begin learning the first concepts of statistics in R which is vital in this fast paced era
and it is also a bargain as you do not need to do a preliminary course on the subject. Summary Beyond Spreadsheets with R shows you how to take raw
data and transform it for use in computations, tables, graphs, and more. You'll build on simple programming techniques like loops and conditionals to
create your own custom functions. You'll come away with a toolkit of strategies for analyzing and visualizing data of all sorts using R and RStudio.
Purchase of the print book includes a free eBook in PDF, Kindle, and ePub formats from Manning Publications. About the Technology Spreadsheets
are powerful tools for many tasks, but if you need to interpret, interrogate, and present data, they can feel like the wrong tools for the task. That's when
R programming is the way to go. The R programming language provides a comfortable environment to properly handle all types of data. And within
the open source RStudio development suite, you have at your fingertips easy-to-use ways to simplify complex manipulations and create reproducible
processes for analysis and reporting. About the Book With Beyond Spreadsheets with R you'll learn how to go from raw data to meaningful insights
using R and RStudio. Each carefully crafted chapter covers a unique way to wrangle data, from understanding individual values to interacting with
complex collections of data, including data you scrape from the web. You'll build on simple programming techniques like loops and conditionals to
create your own custom functions. You'll come away with a toolkit of strategies for analyzing and visualizing data of all sorts. What's inside How to
start programming with R and RStudio Understanding and implementing important R structures and operators Installing and working with R packages
Tidying, refining, and plotting your data About the Reader If you're comfortable writing formulas in Excel, you're ready for this book. About the
Author Dr Jonathan Carroll is a data science consultant providing R programming services. He holds a PhD in theoretical physics. Table of Contents
Introducing data and the R language Getting to know R data types Making new data values Understanding the tools you'll use: Functions Combining
data values Selecting data values Doing things with lots of data Doing things conditionally: Control structures Visualizing data: Plotting Doing more
with your data with extensions Learn how to perform data analysis with the R language and software environment, even if you have little or no
programming experience. With the tutorials in this hands-on guide, youâ??ll learn how to use the essential R tools you need to know to analyze data,
including data types and programming concepts. The second half of Learning R shows you real data analysis in action by covering everything from
importing data to publishing your results. Each chapter in the book includes a quiz on what youâ??ve learned, and concludes with exercises, most of
which involve writing R code. Write a simple R program, and discover what the language can do Use data types such as vectors, arrays, lists, data
frames, and strings Execute code conditionally or repeatedly with branches and loops Apply R add-on packages, and package your own work for
others Learn how to clean data you import from a variety of sources Understand data through visualization and summary statistics Use statistical
models to pass quantitative judgments about data and make predictions Learn what to do when things go wrong while writing data analysis code A
complete guide to carrying out complex survey analysis using R As survey analysis continues to serve as a core component of sociological research,
researchers are increasingly relying upon data gathered from complex surveys to carry out traditional analyses. Complex Surveys is a practical guide to
the analysis of this kind of data using R, the freely available and downloadable statistical programming language. As creator of the specific survey
package for R, the author provides the ultimate presentation of how to successfully use the software for analyzing data from complex surveys while
also utilizing the most current data from health and social sciences studies to demonstrate the application of survey research methods in these fields.
The book begins with coverage of basic tools and topics within survey analysis such as simple and stratified sampling, cluster sampling, linear
regression, and categorical data regression. Subsequent chapters delve into more technical aspects of complex survey analysis, including post-
stratification, two-phase sampling, missing data, and causal inference. Throughout the book, an emphasis is placed on graphics, regression modeling,
and two-phase designs. In addition, the author supplies a unique discussion of epidemiological two-phase designs as well as probability-weighting for
causal inference. All of the book's examples and figures are generated using R, and a related Web site provides the R code that allows readers to
reproduce the presented content. Each chapter concludes with exercises that vary in level of complexity, and detailed appendices outline additional
mathematical and computational descriptions to assist readers with comparing results from various software systems. Complex Surveys is an excellent
book for courses on sampling and complex surveys at the upper-undergraduate and graduate levels. It is also a practical reference guide for applied
statisticians and practitioners in the social and health sciences who use statistics in their everyday work. Doing Meta-Analysis with R: A Hands-On
Guide serves as an accessible introduction on how meta-analyses can be conducted in R. Essential steps for meta-analysis are covered, including
calculation and pooling of outcome measures, forest plots, heterogeneity diagnostics, subgroup analyses, meta-regression, methods to control for
publication bias, risk of bias assessments and plotting tools. Advanced but highly relevant topics such as network meta-analysis, multi-three-level
meta-analyses, Bayesian meta-analysis approaches and SEM meta-analysis are also covered. A companion R package, dmetar, is introduced at the
beginning of the guide. It contains data sets and several helper functions for the meta and metafor package used in the guide. The programming and
statistical background covered in the book are kept at a non-expert level, making the book widely accessible. Features • Contains two introductory
chapters on how to set up an R environment and do basic imports/manipulations of meta-analysis data, including exercises • Describes statistical
concepts clearly and concisely before applying them in R • Includes step-by-step guidance through the coding required to perform meta-analyses, and a



companion R package for the book A hands on guide to web scraping and text mining for both beginners and experienced users of R Introduces
fundamental concepts of the main architecture of the web and databases and covers HTTP, HTML, XML, JSON, SQL. Provides basic techniques to
query web documents and data sets (XPath and regular expressions). An extensive set of exercises are presented to guide the reader through each
technique. Explores both supervised and unsupervised techniques as well as advanced techniques such as data scraping and text management. Case
studies are featured throughout along with examples for each technique presented. R code and solutions to exercises featured in the book are provided
on a supporting website. This book provides hands-on guidance for researchers and practitioners in criminal justice and criminology to perform
statistical analyses and data visualization in the free and open-source software R. It offers a step-by-step guide for beginners to become familiar with
the RStudio platform and tidyverse set of packages. This volume will help users master the fundamentals of the R programming language, providing
tutorials in each chapter that lay out research questions and hypotheses centering around a real criminal justice dataset, such as data from the National
Survey on Drug Use and Health, National Crime Victimization Survey, Youth Risk Behavior Surveillance System, The Monitoring the Future Study,
and The National Youth Survey. Users will also learn how to manipulate common sources of agency data, such as calls-for-service (CFS) data. The
end of each chapter includes exercises that reinforce the R tutorial examples, designed to help master the software as well as to provide practice on
statistical concepts, data analysis, and interpretation of results. The text can be used as a stand-alone guide to learning R or it can be used as a
companion guide to an introductory statistics textbook, such as Basic Statistics in Criminal Justice (2020). This easy-to-follow textbook provides a
student-friendly introduction to programming and algorithms. Emphasis is placed on the threshold concepts that present barriers to learning, including
the questions that students are often too embarrassed to ask. The book promotes an active learning style in which a deeper understanding is gained
from evaluating, questioning, and discussing the material, and practised in hands-on exercises. Although R is used as the language of choice for all
programs, strict assumptions are avoided in the explanations in order for these to remain applicable to other programming languages. Features:
provides exercises at the end of each chapter; includes three mini projects in the final chapter; presents a list of titles for further reading at the end of
the book; discusses the key aspects of loops, recursions, program and algorithm efficiency and accuracy, sorting, linear systems of equations, and file
processing; requires no prior background knowledge in this area. This new book written by the developers of R Markdown is an essential reference
that will help users learn and make full use of the software. Those new to R Markdown will appreciate the short, practical examples that address the
most common issues users encounter. Frequent users will also benefit from the wide ranging tips and tricks that expose ‘hidden’ features, support
customization and demonstrate the many new and varied applications of the software. After reading this book users will learn how to: Enhance your R
Markdown content with diagrams, citations, and dynamically generated text Streamline your workflow with child documents, code chunk references,
and caching Control the formatting and layout with Pandoc markdown syntax or by writing custom HTML and LaTeX templates Utilize chunk options
and hooks to fine-tune how your code is processed Switch between different language engineers to seamlessly incorporate python, D3, and more into
your analysis 2020- Second Edition, updated version. Get your copy!! Why Learn R? What are the reasons to learn R for Data Science? In this small
textbook recommended for absolute beginners, the author tried to answer these types of questions. After reading this guide, maybe in one or two days,
you will learn the basics of R programming and its utility for each Data Scientist. Indeed, R is a programming language and software environment for
statistical analysis, graphics representation, and reporting. If you are trying to understand the R programming language as a beginner, this short book
will give you enough understanding of almost all the concepts of the R language. The author will guide you through examples, how to program in R
and how to use R for effective data analysis.Get your copy Now! Book Objectives This book is about R programming. The following are the objectives
of the author: To familiarize you with the basics of R programming language. To help you understand the various fields where R can be applied and its
use cases in each field. To equip you with R programming skills, both beginner and advanced skills. To introduce you to R programming for data
analysis. To introduce you to R programming for machine learning. To help you understand and appreciate the power of R in statistical computing,
data analysis, and scientific research. Who this Book is for? Anybody who is a complete beginner to R Programming. Anybody in need of advancing
their R Programming skills. Professionals in computer programming. Professors, lecturers or tutors who are looking to find better ways to explain R
programming to their students in the simplest and easiest way. Students and academicians, especially those focusing on R, Data Analysis,Machine
Learning , computer science, and Databases development. Requirements The author expects you to have a computer installed with an operating system
such as Linux, Windows or Mac OS X. What is inside the book? R BASICS R DATA TYPES R VARIABLES AND CONSTANTS R OPERATORS
DECISION MAKING IN R R LOOPS R FUNCTIONS R CLASSES AND OBJECTS R FOR DATA SCIENCE R FOR MACHINE LEARNING
From the Back Cover. R programming language is one of the most popular languages used by statisticians, data analysts, researchers to retrieve, clean,
analyze, visualize and present data. This is a comprehensive book on how to get started with R programming, why you should learn it and how you can
learn it. Daniel Bell begins by introducing the readers to the foundations of the R programming language. The aim is to help you understand, how the R
interpreter works, the origin of the name R, how to set up the R programming environment, etc. The author has discussed the process of installing R on
Windows, Linux and Mac OS. Moreover, the author has explored the basics of R programming including writing comments, using the R console,
creating R script files, etc. The various features provided by R have been discussed in depth, including data types, variables, loops, decision making,
functions, operators, classes, and objects, etc. The author has also discussed R for data science and R for machine learning. The book has been
organized into chapters, with each chapter having many sub-chapters. R code scripts have been provided, alongside thorough explanations of the code
and images showing the expected output upon the execution of every script. Get your copy You’re no idiot, of course. You’re familiar with the Four
Horsemen of the Apocalypse and Judgment Day—especially in the wake of the new millennium. However, the Book of Revelation has existed for
almost 2,000 years and is open to countless interpretations. Don’t get confused by scholarly analysis and religious dogma! The Complete Idiot’s
Guide® to the Book of Revelation shows you how so many meanings are derived from the book’s text. In this Complete Idiot’s Guide®, you get: •
Various ways to interpret Revelation and its symbols • A detailed examination of the key elements, including the Seven Seals and the Antichrist • A
look at how the Jewish Old Testament and prophecies relate to Revelation The only how-to guide offering a unified, systemic approach to acquiring,
cleaning, and managing data in R Every experienced practitioner knows that preparing data for modeling is a painstaking, time-consuming process.
Adding to the difficulty is that most modelers learn the steps involved in cleaning and managing data piecemeal, often on the fly, or they develop their
own ad hoc methods. This book helps simplify their task by providing a unified, systematic approach to acquiring, modeling, manipulating, cleaning,
and maintaining data in R. Starting with the very basics, data scientists Samuel E. Buttrey and Lyn R. Whitaker walk readers through the entire
process. From what data looks like and what it should look like, they progress through all the steps involved in getting data ready for modeling. They
describe best practices for acquiring data from numerous sources; explore key issues in data handling, including text/regular expressions, big data,
parallel processing, merging, matching, and checking for duplicates; and outline highly efficient and reliable techniques for documenting data and
recordkeeping, including audit trails, getting data back out of R, and more. The only single-source guide to R data and its preparation, it describes best
practices for acquiring, manipulating, cleaning, and maintaining data Begins with the basics and walks readers through all the steps necessary to get
data ready for the modeling process Provides expert guidance on how to document the processes described so that they are reproducible Written by
seasoned professionals, it provides both introductory and advanced techniques Features case studies with supporting data and R code, hosted on a
companion website A Data Scientist's Guide to Acquiring, Cleaning and Managing Data in R is a valuable working resource/bench manual for
practitioners who collect and analyze data, lab scientists and research associates of all levels of experience, and graduate-level data mining students.
Presenting a comprehensive resource for the mastery of network analysis in R, the goal of Network Analysis with R is to introduce modern network
analysis techniques in R to social, physical, and health scientists. The mathematical foundations of network analysis are emphasized in an accessible
way and readers are guided through the basic steps of network studies: network conceptualization, data collection and management, network
description, visualization, and building and testing statistical models of networks. As with all of the books in the Use R! series, each chapter contains



extensive R code and detailed visualizations of datasets. Appendices will describe the R network packages and the datasets used in the book. An R
package developed specifically for the book, available to readers on GitHub, contains relevant code and real-world network datasets as well. Master
the programming language of choice among statisticians and data analysts worldwide Coming to grips with R can be tough, even for seasoned
statisticians and data analysts. Enter R For Dummies, the quick, easy way to master all the R you'll ever need. Requiring no prior programming
experience and packed with practical examples, easy, step-by-step exercises, and sample code, this extremely accessible guide is the ideal introduction
to R for complete beginners. It also covers many concepts that intermediate-level programmers will find extremely useful. Master your R ABCs ? get
up to speed in no time with the basics, from installing and configuring R to writing simple scripts and performing simultaneous calculations on many
variables Put data in its place ? get to know your way around lists, data frames, and other R data structures while learning to interact with other
programs, such as Microsoft Excel Make data dance to your tune ? learn how to reshape and manipulate data, merge data sets, split and combine data,
perform calculations on vectors and arrays, and much more Visualize it ? learn to use R's powerful data visualization features to create beautiful and
informative graphical presentations of your data Get statistical ? find out how to do simple statistical analysis, summarize your variables, and conduct
classic statistical tests, such as t-tests Expand and customize R ? get the lowdown on how to find, install, and make the most of add-on packages
created by the global R community for a wide variety of purposes Open the book and find: Help downloading, installing, and configuring R Tips for
getting data in and out of R Ways to use data frames and lists to organize data How to manipulate and process data Advice on fitting regression models
and ANOVA Helpful hints for working with graphics How to code in R What R mailing lists and forums can do for you
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