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Important Notice: Media content referenced within the product description or the product text may not be available in the ebook version. Trust the number one tax preparation text to introduce your students to individual income tax
preparation using a proven forms approach with a hands-on workbook format. As the market-leading tax preparation text for 28 years, INCOME TAX FUNDAMENTALS 2010 Edition provides a concise, practical, and time-tested
introduction to the most important areas of the tax law. Easy-to-read sections incorporate real examples using actual tax forms. This edition presents intriguing, real, and often humorous tax situations to maintain student interest. The
self-study problems and solutions encourage students to work in a step-by-step manner to build on concepts gradually. Strong end-of-chapter reinforcement, including online interactive quizzes, further prepares students for career
success. Whittenburg/Altus-Buller's text provides up-to-the-minute tax information and is revised annually. With the help of INCOME TAX FUNDAMENTALS' comprehensive support package and complete presentation, students
with leave the course with the knowledge and skills to handle the challenges of today's tax preparers. Important Notice: Media content referenced within the product description or the product text may not be available in the ebook
version. Learn the complexities of the U.S. income tax code and master the most important areas of tax law with Whittenburg/Gill's concise, practical INCOME TAX FUNDAMENTALS 2019. This market-leading introduction to tax
preparation uses a unique, step-by-step workbook format that integrates actual tax forms. You have the option to use Intuit ProConnect 2018 tax preparation software that accompanies each new book. A clear, up-to-date presentation
walks you through real, current examples using the most recent actual tax forms. A variety of end-of-chapter problems offer hands-on practice with tax return problems that use source documents identical to those of real clients. In
addition, numerous study tools and powerful online resources, including MindTap digital support and the CengageNOWv2 online homework tool, help you further refine the knowledge and skills to become a successful tax preparer.
Discover a concise, practical, and time-tested introduction for mastering the most important areas of tax law with INCOME TAX FUNDAMENTALS 2018. For more than 30 years this book has led the market with a unique, clear,
step-by-step workbook format that walks readers through real examples using actual tax forms. The book's specific content also prepares readers to use actual, leading tax preparation software. Numerous study and practice tools help
ensure readers thoroughly understand the concepts. INCOME TAX FUNDAMENTALS 2018 effectively equips readers with the knowledge and practical skills to become successful tax preparers. Important Notice: Media content
referenced within the product description or the product text may not be available in the ebook version. INCOME TAX FUNDAMENTALS 2013 provides readers with a concise, practical, and time-tested introduction to the most
important areas of tax law. For more than 30 years, this textbook has been the market-leading standard due to its step-by-step workbook format that walks readers through real examples using actual tax forms. With plentiful study
tools, including online interactive self-quizzes, INCOME TAX FUNDAMENTALS 2013 ensures that readers gain the knowledge and skills they’ll need as future tax preparers. Important Notice: Media content referenced within the
product description or the product text may not be available in the ebook version. A concise, practical guide to California state income taxation, Whittenburg/Raabe/Altus-Buller's text/workbook format presents material in easy-to-
digest sections. Using multiple examples and review problems, it is perfect as a stand-alone text or as a supplement to any tax text where an emphasis on California state income taxes is desired. The third edition of The Fundamentals
of Federal Taxation is a problem-based, transaction-oriented treatment of the basics of federal taxation. It features a balanced approach toward tax planning and tax policy and is structured for easy accessibility through the use of forty-
two chapters, each of which can readily be covered in one, or occasionally two, class sessions. A new chapter in this edition brings together the various exclusions, deductions and credits concerning education. This is a topic of
particular relevance to students that often receives scattered treatment in other books. Thoroughly up to date, this edition incorporates the changes arising from the American Taxpayer Relief Act of 2012, the so-called ¿fiscal cliff¿
legislation. The authors also prepare an annual supplement each August. The first half of the book provides students with an understanding of the overall structure of the federal income tax. This part culminates in two major review
problems that assist students in integrating the knowledge gained. Thereafter, the book covers various major topics of taxation¿including real estate taxation, intellectual property taxation, family taxation, tax consequences of litigation,
and deferred compensation -- with an emphasis on tax planning. It is designed to give students an appreciation for how the law of taxation connects with everyday events of American life. The book also contains chapters on corporate
and partnership income taxation, international income taxation and the federal wealth transfer taxes in order to introduce students to those important areas of tax law. In this cogent, straightforward treatment of a complex subject, the
topics, the selection of cases, and the design of the problems are all calculated to make tax fun and thought-provoking. This edition is available in both hard copy and electronic versions. A teacher¿s manual with complete solutions to
all of the problems is available. A concise, practical guide to personal federal income tax form preparation. The text/workbook format presents material in easy-to-digest sections with multiple examples, cases, and review problems.
Perfect for a hands-on approach to taxes! A concise, practical guide to California state income taxation, Whittenburg/Raabe/Altus-Buller's workbook format presents material in easy-to-digest sections. Using multiple examples and
review problems, it is perfect where an emphasis on California state income taxes is desired. Are you fearful about making costly mistakes on your income tax filing and missing out on personal and business income tax deductions?
Now you will no longer need to feel worried about expensive errors when it is time to file your income tax return. This tax guide book will provide you with tax help and advice on the most relevant tax strategies and deductions
available. You will learn about what to look for when hiring tax preparation services versus doing your own income tax return, find out about interesting tax history, facts & trivia, and get information about what is found on a tax
organizer that will help you put together your annual tax documents and reporting information. You will also learn all about income tax deductions and gain access to tax deduction lists for multiple different professions including
airline personnel, business professionals, day care providers, direct sellers, educators, firefighters, hairstylists, manicurists, law enforcement officers, long haul truckers and realtors along with a vehicle, travel & entertainment expense
worksheet. You will find out about estimated tax payments, tax software, and income tax resolution options that are available should you ever run into an issue. You will also gain insight on how to handle tax liability payments, and
get reviews on different accounting & tax software options for doing your own bookkeeping and income tax preparation. Learn your income tax fundamentals, and get the tax help you need to save time and money on your income
taxes with this valuable must have tax playbook. Discover a concise, practical, and time-tested introduction to the most important areas of tax law with INCOME TAX FUNDAMENTALS 2017. For more than 30 years, this book has
led the market with a clear, step-by-step workbook format that walks readers through real examples using actual tax forms. With numerous learning and study tools built into the book, INCOME TAX FUNDAMENTALS 2017 helps
readers master the knowledge and practical skills to become successful tax preparers. Important Notice: Media content referenced within the product description or the product text may not be available in the ebook version. Learn the
complexities of the U.S. income tax code and master the most important areas of tax law with Whittenburg/Altus-Buller/Gill's concise, practical INCOME TAX FUNDAMENTALS 2020. This market-leading introduction to tax
preparation uses a unique, step-by-step workbook format that integrates actual tax forms. You have the option to use Intuit ProConnect 2019 tax preparation software that accompanies each new book. A clear, up-to-date presentation
walks you through real, current examples using the most recent actual tax forms. A variety of end-of-chapter problems offer hands-on practice with tax return problems that use source documents identical to those of real clients. In
addition, numerous study tools and powerful online resources, including MindTap digital support and the CengageNOWv2 online homework tool, help you further refine the knowledge and skills to become a successful tax preparer.
Master the most important areas of today's tax law with Whittenburg/Altus-Buller/Gill's best-selling INCOME TAX FUNDAMENTALS 2022. This concise, practical introduction to tax preparation uses a unique, step-by-step
workbook format that integrates actual tax forms. You learn the complexities of the U.S. income tax code as this edition's clear, up-to-date presentation walks you through real, current examples using the most recent tax forms. A
variety of end-of-chapter problems and online exercises offers hands-on practice with tax return problems that use source documents identical to those of real clients. Professional Intuit ProConnect• tax preparation software also
accompanies each new book. In addition, numerous study tools and powerful online resources, including the CengageNOWv2 online homework tool, help you further refine your knowledge and practical skills to become a successful
tax preparer today. Master the most important areas of today's tax law with Whittenburg/Gill's best-selling INCOME TAX FUNDAMENTALS 2024, 42nd EDITION. This concise, practical introduction to tax preparation uses a
unique, step-by-step workbook format that integrates real, current examples and uses the most recent actual tax forms. You learn the complexities of the U.S. income tax code as this edition's clear, up-to-date presentation walks you
through the most recent tax laws, revisions and changes. Updated end-of-chapter problems and online exercises let you practice completing tax return problems using real source documents identical to those of actual clients. You also
learn to use professional Intuit® ProConnect(tm) tax preparation software that accompanies each new book. In addition, study tools and helpful resources within CNOWv2, the online learning platform, help you further refine your
knowledge and practical skills to become a successful tax preparer. INCOME TAX FUNDAMENTALS 2014 provides you with a concise, practical, and time-tested introduction to the most important areas of tax law. For more than
30 years, this textbook has been the market-leading standard due to its step-by-step workbook format that walks you through real examples using actual tax forms. With plentiful study tools, INCOME TAX FUNDAMENTALS will
help you gain the knowledge and skills to become a future tax preparer. Important Notice: Media content referenced within the product description or the product text may not be available in the ebook version. Trust the number one
tax preparation text to introduce your students to individual income tax preparation using a proven forms approach with a hands-on workbook format. As the market-leading tax preparation text for 29 years, INCOME TAX
FUNDAMENTALS 2011 Edition provides a concise, practical, and time-tested introduction to the most important areas of the tax law. Easy-to-read sections incorporate real examples using actual tax forms. This edition presents
intriguing, real, and often humorous tax situations to maintain student interest. Self-study problems and solutions encourage students to work in a step-by-step manner to build on concepts gradually. Strong end-of-chapter
reinforcement, including online interactive quizzes, further prepares students for career success. Whittenburg/Altus-Buller’s text provides up-to-the-minute tax information and is revised annually. With the help of INCOME TAX
FUNDAMENTALS’ comprehensive support package and complete presentation, students will leave the course with the knowledge and skills to handle the challenges of today’s tax preparers. Important Notice: Media content
referenced within the product description or the product text may not be available in the ebook version. Learn the complexities of the U.S. income tax code and master the most important areas of tax law with Whittenburg/Altus-
Buller/Gill's concise, practical INCOME TAX FUNDAMENTALS 2021. This market-leading introduction to tax preparation uses a unique, step-by-step workbook format that integrates actual tax forms. You have the option to use
Intuit ProConnect tax preparation software that accompanies each new book. A clear, up-to-date presentation walks you through real, current examples using the most recent actual tax forms. A variety of end-of-chapter problems offer
hands-on practice with tax return problems that use source documents identical to those of real clients. In addition, numerous study tools and powerful online resources, including MindTap digital support and the CengageNOWv2
online homework tool, help you further refine the knowledge and skills to become a successful tax preparer. Master the most important areas of today's tax law with Whittenburg/Gill's best-selling INCOME TAX FUNDAMENTALS
2023. This concise, practical introduction to tax preparation uses a unique, step-by-step workbook format that integrates real, current examples and uses the most recent actual tax forms. You learn the complexities of the U.S. income
tax code as this edition's clear, up-to-date presentation walks you through the most recent tax laws, revisions and changes. Updated end-of-chapter problems and online exercises let you practice completing tax return problems using
real source documents identical to those of actual clients. You also learn to use professional Intuit® ProConnect(tm) tax preparation software that accompanies each new book. In addition, study tools and helpful resources within the
CNOWv2 online homework tool help you further refine your knowledge and practical skills to become a successful tax preparer. INCOME TAX FUNDAMENTALS 2012, 30E provides a concise, practical, and time-tested
introduction to the most important areas of tax law. For over thirty years, this textbook has been the market-leading standard due to its step-by-step workbook format that incorporates real examples using actual tax forms. And, with
strong end-of-chapter reinforcement, including online interactive quizzes, INCOME TAX FUNDAMENTALS 2012, 30E makes sure that students have gain the knowledge and skills they’ll need as future tax preparers. Important
Notice: Media content referenced within the product description or the product text may not be available in the ebook version. Income Tax Fundamentals has led the market for more than twenty years with concise, practical, and
current coverage of individual income tax preparation. Whittenburg and Altus-Buller's text/workbook format presents material in easy-to-digest sections with self-checks, online quizzes and activities, multiple examples, and review
problems. Income Tax Fundamentals is the perfect text for a hands-on approach to tax in many class settings, including four-year colleges, community colleges, or career schools.
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